11/27/2017 Weber Fire District Mail - Re: Subdivision Review

Re: Subdivision Review
1 message

Brandon Thueson <bthueson@weberfd.com>

toliver73@aol.com <toliver73@aol.com> Wed, Nov 22, 2017 at 3:14 PM

To: bthueson@weberfd.com

Hi Brandon.

Thanks for the time to speak with me today. Regarding your comments on my parcel, I'm aware of the requirements that
you listed. As we discussed | will make sure that the fire suppression, hydrant, and turnarounds will all be addressed with

the building permit application. | also believe that we were able to meet the 10% road requirement as well as the clear

space for the driveway. If you need anything further from me at this moment please let me know, and thanks again for all

your help with this project.

Matt Toliver

————— Original Message-----

From: Brandon Thueson <bthueson@weberfd.com>

To: toliver73 <toliver73@aol.com>

Cc: Andrea Fiske <afiske@weberfd.com>; Cierra Mullins <cmullins@weberfd.com>; David Reed
<dreed@weberfd.com>

Sent: Thu, Nov 16, 2017 2:49 pm

Subject: Re: Subdivision Review

Sorry, | forgot to attach the document.
Brandon Thueson
Deputy Chief/Fire Marshal

Weber Fire District
801-782-3580 Ext. 205

On Thu, Nov 16, 2017 at 2:47 PM, Brandon Thueson <bthueson@weberfd.com> wrote:
Matt,

| completed the review for your subdivision. Thanks for working with me on the road over the past year or so. This
helped the review go easier. Please review the comments and let me know if you have questions.

Please contact Andrea or Cierra at 801-782-3580 to arrange payment of the fees.
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11/27/2017

Date: November 16, 2017

Project Name: MWT Estate Subdivision

Weber Fire District Mail - Re: Subdivision Review

Project Address: 5025 Old Snowbasin Road, Huntsville Ut 84317
Contractor/Contact: Matthew Toliver 801-745-9435 toliver73(@aol.com

Fees:
Property Type Schedule Rates Sgquare Foot Rate Sguare Feet or Number of Res. Units Total
Type Rate Rate/ Sq Ft 5q Ft or# of Units Total
Plan Review 1LlotSubdivision S50.00
Reslidential Impact Fee 22815 5000
50,00
50,00
Total Due 550.00

FEE NOTICE:

Weber Fire District has various fees associated with plan reviews, and inspections. Please be prepared to

make payments at the time of inspections or when vou pick up vour approved plans. Impact Fees are due|
prior to taking out a building permit. Make checks payable to: Weber Fire District.

Brandon Thueson

Deputy Chief/Fire Marshal

Weber Fire District
801-782-3580 Ext. 205
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